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As Deepavali approaches we see the now familiar 
pattern of Hindu festival bashing with an ugly 
discourse of ‘Hindu festivals are environment 
unfriendly’. Uninformed ignorant celebrities start 
dissuading Hindus from bursting crackers as if the 
current deplorable environmental crisis is all a 
consequence of Hindus reveling in their festive spirit 
for a couple of days. The judiciary too do not want to 
be, left behind and profess their available insight by 
imposing a blanket ban on the sale of firecrackers 
across the country. However, no one of these self-
proclaimed intelligent people have any exalted 
wisdom to offer on the ongoing continuous carpet-
bombing taking place in Ukraine or in the Middle 
East region and its adverse impact on the world 
environmental pollution.  

Holi, Ganesha Chaturthi, Durga Puja, Dusshera or 
Deepavali, every time we see Hindus falsely targeted 
in the names of pollution, sometimes water, 
sometimes noise and sometimes air. The judiciary 
banning the sale of crackers citing the reason of 
environmental air pollution is flawed by itself as 
scientific studies show why the whole positioning of 
Deepavali as the culprit is incorrect, since it ignores 
other major reasons like lifestyle, construction, 
the burning of stubble as responsible bringing with it 
a cloud of smog, causing numerous respiratory 
problems for the citizens. However, the fact remains 
that Hinduism has always been an environmentally 
sensitive philosophy, as most Hindu festivals and 
traditions share a healthy relationship with the 
environment and are eco-friendly in character. 

This well-coordinated and concerted machination by 
anti-Hindu forces is to make Hindus feel guilty about 
their festivals and traditions that would result in 
many naïve young Hindus distance themselves from 
the rich cultural heritage, with a clear goal to 
Balkanize Bharat into pieces. In a paper titled 
‘Spiritual Conflict in the Indian context‘, a 
missionary movement identified ‘Unity of India’ as a 
major roadblock to Christian Evangelization. The 
spirit of being Indian is the binding factor which has 

totally integrated the country into one culture and 
this display of ‘unity in diversity’, portrays Bharat as 
one entity. What we could consider as the merits of 
Bharat, are unfortunately the deterrents for 
evangelization’. Christian Evangelists strongly 
believe that our rich Cultural Heritage and our 
festivals, is what binds Hindus. So, the whole idea of 
these forces is that, if they can distance the Hindus 
from their festivals, it could serve their purpose, i.e., 
they can easily disintegrate this ‘Unity in Diversity’. 

Keeping away Hindus from bursting fire crackers is 
only one of the various steps. Unfortunately, many 
Indians due to regular and continuous brainwashing 
by these anti-Hindu, anti-Bharat forces think that 
bursting crackers was never a part of Bharatiya 
tradition and so there is no need to continue it. These 
people believe that bursting firecrackers during 
Deepavali is a recently introduced innovation 
whereas the reality of bursting firecrackers has 
always been integral to Deepavali celebrations. The 
very crux of the myth viz., bursting firecrackers is not 
a part of the Bharatiya tradition is based on the false 
presumption that China invented gunpowder (and so 
fireworks) in the 9th century and then falsely 
crediting Muslims to have brought it to Bharat. This 
myth is so widespread that, such ignorant people 
even go on to say that gunpowder is one of the ‘Four 
Great Inventions’ of China. However, this myth starts 
falling apart when we examine Chinese sources 
themselves which says that a Bharatiya Buddhist 
monk brought gunpowder technology to China, in 
664 CE, when he discovered soils in China containing 
Saltpeter (primary constituent of gunpowder). 
Various Chinese studies of chemistry of Saltpeter 
itself show evidence of its Bharatiya origin.  

Fireworks have been an integral part of Bharatiya 
culture cutting across, caste, creed and gender for 
several centuries. The major constituent of fireworks 
is Gunpowder which consists of Saltpeter (Potassium 
Nitrate), Sulfur and Charcoal that act as fuel to 
prolong combustion. Saltpeter gives the 
characteristic purple flame in fireworks both for 
military and aesthetic (celebratory) uses. Many 
world historians confirm that ancient Bharat had a 
complete knowledge of gunpowder’s. Dr Gustav 
Oppert (a German Indologist) the foremost among 
them has done extensive research on this and has 
been an authority on this subject. Authors and 
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historians around the world widely accept and quote 
the research works of Dr. Oppert in their books. 

As already mentioned earlier, much before Chinese 
invented gunpowder, Indians have been using it. It 
finds mentions and references in Ancient Sanskrit 
texts namely ‘Kautilya’s Artha Sastra’ by Chanakya 
and ‘Sukra Niti’ or the teachings of Sukra Charya, 
referring to Saltpeter as ‘Agnichurna’, for producing 
smoke and useful to fight the enemy during the wars.  

This document is at least 2300 years ago, very much 
before Islam was born and Muslims invaded Bharat.  

Many writings also refer, ‘Arabs learnt the 
manufacture of gunpowder from India, and that 
before their Indian connection they had used arrows 
of naphtha. Some also argue that though Persia 
possessed Saltpeter in abundance, the original home 
of gunpowder was India…’ (Fire-Arms in Ancient 
India – By Jogesh Chandra Ray I.H.Q. viii. p. 586-
88) 

Gustav Oppert (1836-1908) in his work, Political 
Maxims of the Ancient Hindus, says, that ancient 
India was the original home of gunpowder and fire-
arms. (Hindu Culture and The Modern Age – By 
Dewan Bahadur K.S. Ramaswami Shastri – 
Annamalai University 1956 p. 127) 

The major constituent of fireworks is Gunpowder 
which comprises of Saltpeter (Potassium Nitrate), 
Sulfur and Charcoal. While the Sulfur and Charcoal 
act as fuel to prolong the combustion, it is the 
Saltpeter that gives the characteristic purple flame 
due to which fireworks use it not only for military but 
also aesthetic (celebratory) purposes. Moreover, 
Chinese texts dating back to 7th century acknowledge 
that Indians were aware of Saltpeter and its usage for 
producing purple flames for aesthetic purposes apart 
from military use. How would Hindus would have 
made use of Saltpeter for aesthetics without giving it 
some kind of structural form i.e., Fireworks? 

Scholar Roger Pauly, a hardcore Sinophile, in his 
writings admits ‘Indian inspiration’.  

Although, 9th to 10th century onwards the initial 
knowledge of gunpowder came to China from Bharat, 
without doubt we must agree that the Chinese 
improvised and made innovative contribution to 
gunpowder technology by making different types and 
forms of fireworks for celebratory use, like sky 
sparklers, skylight fountains, skyrockets, etc.  

The narrator of Mahabharata, Vaisampayana 
describes the manufacture of smoke balls by ancient 
Hindus using Gunpowder that many scholars agree 
with.  

Atharvan Rahasya mentions the use of charcoal, 
Sulfur and Saltpeter to make gunpowder, which are 

the same ingredients used even today to manufacture 
Gunpowder. 

In-fact, workers at Sivakasi (Tamil Nadu) and all 
over in Andra Pradesh use these ingredients to make 
modern fireworks even today. 

Traditional makers of fire crackers to this day make 
simple form of crackers, using basic ingredients like 

• Suryakara (सरू्यकार, Telugu) = Saltpeter  

• Gandhaka (गन्धक) = Sulphur. 

• Sand. 

These were known in Bharat since ancient ages and 
there is no need for Bharatiya’s to borrow this from 
China. The etymology of the ingredients in fireworks 
reveals their origin. The traditional Bharatiya 
firecracker workers of Andhra and Sivakasi still call 

the Indic Saltpeter as (सूर्यकार) whose origin is 

Sanskritic. They do not use Shora (शोरा  شورہ) which is 

Persian word for Saltpeter imported in medieval age 
by Muslims invaders during their rule.  

An extremely colonized mindset alone can claim that 
Hindus were incapable of making simple fireworks 
themselves when they had all basic ingredients since 
antiquity and Hindu society had to wait for Muslims 
to come and teach them to put all these ingredients 
in a container and make fireworks. The facts are 
clear, and i.e., Hindus had a complete knowledge 
about use of Saltpeter and gunpowder and were 
perfectly capable of making fireworks themselves.  

Why we burst fireworks in Deepavali and 
what is the underlying theology?  

Hindus believe that our departed ancestors (Pitrs) 
who had come down for Pitru Paksha would return 
on the night of Deepavali Chaturdashi and 
Amavasya. The light and noise show Pitrs their path 
in the dark. Hence, we illuminate our houses. The 
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Skanda Purāṇ a the largest of the 18 MahāPurāṇ as, 
describes the rites we must perform on Deepavali 
and it mentions this belief. The Vaiṣ ṇ ava-khaṇ ḍ a of 
Skanda Purāṇ a says 

 

The Skanda Purana says that we should celebrate 
Deepavali by holding Ulkas in our hands as this will 
show path to our ancestors by serving its two main 
purposes. 

1) Make noise  
2) Illuminate the sky. 

What are ‘Ulkas’?  

In Sanskrit the original meaning of Ulkā (उल्का) is a 

‘meteor’. If the ancient combustibles used in 
Deepavali were just lamps, how could the ancients 
give this name. Fireworks were Ulkas, because of the 
similar visual appearance of fire crackers to meteors. 
G. V. Tagare translates it as ‘firebrands. [Firecrackers 
in their early form were firebrands]. Such firebrands 
illuminated the sky which explains commentators 

describing उल्काहस्ता of Skanda Purana as दीप, 

changing the meaning of this word with time. This 
was older, original form. See this painting from Mir 
Kalan school depicts what is close to older form: 

 

Firecrackers used in ancient Bharat were surely 
different from today’s modern fire crackers. Just 
because the chairs used in ancient Bharat were 
different from modern chairs, can we conclude that 
chairs did not exist in Bharat earlier? Everything we 
use today are different from its predecessor. It is 
quite simple to understand that the concept of 
firecrackers or the use of a combustible substance on 
the night of Deepavali to make a lot of noise, and 
illuminate the sky and show the path to our departed 
ancestors existed irrespective of whether Ulka means 
modern fire crackers or not. Advancement of 
technology, changes everything, but that does not 
mean that firecrackers is a foreign import or 
medieval 16th century concept.  

Dr. G. V. Raghavan professor of Sanskrit and 
historian after analyzing these verses, concludes that 
(an early form of) crackers have been a part of 
Deepavali celebrations since earliest times. He says 
that their religious purpose was to illuminate and 
resonate the path of departed Pitrs. 
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In her thesis, Indologist Tracy Pintchman says that 
the core of Deepavali festivity is illuminating the path 
of deceased ancestors with firecrackers and lights, a 
strongly corroborated fact in Ananda Ramayana an 
epic by Maharishi Valmiki, that also mentions that 
people burst fireworks during Lord Rama’s 
homecoming. It mentions about firecrackers which 
burst and shine in the sky (gaganantarvirajitan). 

Some colonial Indologist object saying that Ananda 
Ramayaṇa is a work of 15th century. However, these 
very same colonized Indologists assign a date of 500-
100 BCE (i.e., post Buddha) for Valmiki Ramayaṇa. 

In Hindu Dharma, date does not determine validity 
unlike other religious faiths, but the acceptance of 
the texts among Sampradayas. Ananda Ramayana 
easily qualifies such test since most Sampradayas 
accepts it is genuine.  

We see such an idea in Medhātithi’s 11th century 
commentary on Manu Smriti 2.6. He says that 
persons learned in the Veda and has the authority of 
Smriti carry of the practice (in our case the bursting 
of firecrackers), is to acquire some important and 
valuable invisible results.  

Hard archaeological evidence for all festivals is 
present in wall murals of the 9th century Tyagaraja 
temple in Tamil Nadu. They depict festival 
celebrations with firecrackers. 

See alongside. 

Bogar SattaKandam a book attributed to Tamil 
Siddha Saint Bogar, traditionally dated to 500 BCE, 
which some modern scholars date as 5-7th century 
CE, clearly describes the use of Deepavali 
firecrackers. 

Bogar describes the method of preparing the 
Saltpeter solution (Vediuppu Cheyanir) for all types 
of Sarakku Vaippu. Fireworks, gunpowder etc.  
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A painting of Krishna watching Deepavali fireworks. 
From Kishangarh (Rajasthan) 

Hindu tradition civilizational memory always 
remembers and considers firecrackers as an integral 
part of Hindu tradition with thousands of paintings 
made all over Bharat showing Sri Krishna celebrating 
Deepavalili by bursting firecrackers. 

Here is one from Rajasthan school: 

Colonialized Indologist object saying these paintings 
belongs to the 16th century. This is precisely the point 
to note that Hindu art and tradition do not see 
firecrackers as an alien custom absent in Sri 
Krishna’s era. How is it possible they remember 
these medieval fireworks as a successor of something 
which had ancient roots in Bharat and in their 
memory had been integral part of Hindu culture? 
Hindu civilizational memory does not see Deepavali 
firecrackers as an alien import. Rather it is exactly 
the opposite.  

Were our Hindu ancestors such idi0ts that they made 
thousands of paintings depicting Sri Krishna 

celebrating fireworks which may not have existed 
during his time? Think about it! 

As another example of civilizational memory, is the 
great Marathi Saint Eknath (16th cent CE) who 
describes firecracker celebrations in the wedding of 
Rukmini and Krishna.  

He describes Agniyantra, Havai, Sumanmala, 
Chichundari, Bhuinala etc. We find all these fire 
crackers even today in Deccan. 

Chatrapati Shivaji Maharaj’s Guru, the great Sant 
Samarth Ramdas also describes various kinds of 
fireworks burst by Sri Rama’s army in his Ramayana. 
Firecrackers described are havaiya, nala, phula 
(phuljhari), ghosha etc. 

Take Kaunriya Kathi of Odisha. It is a basic Deepavali 
firebrand without gunpowder. But it illuminates and 
makes noise. 
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Let us pause and logically think ourselves. If Muslims 
had imported firecrackers from China, the inevitable 
conclusion is that all the great Hindu painters, poets 
and scholars were collectively wrong and deluding 
themselves when they mentioned fireworks in 
ancient Bharat.  

At one point (surely before Muslim age), Saltpeter 
was present in firebrands. While use of such 
firecrackers gradually became widespread, more 
conservative ones persisted with the older form of 
firebrands which explains why few ancient texts 
describe this innovation. To understand all this we 
just need some simple common sense.  

Practical use of fire crackers in ancient 
Bharat by our ancestors. 

Hindus celebrate Deepavali to mark the return of 
Bhagwan Ram and Devi Maa Sita, to Ayodhya after 
their exile. However, it also signifies the beginning of 
the autumn season (early days) that bring changes in 
the climate and the environmental ecosystem which 
our ancestors were aware of. 

Bharat is an agricultural society with rice as the 
staple food for most of the states. During the month 
of autumn ‘tiny leafhopper’ (an insect of the 
cicadellidae family) grows in large numbers. Feeding 
on plant sap these insects transmit plant-infecting 
viruses and bacteria.  

Numerous species of leafhoppers and planthoppers 
are present worldwide that are serious pests of rice, 
frequently occurring in large numbers enough to 
completely dry the crop, or at least to reduce the rice 
yields. Apart from direct crop damage, leafhoppers 
and plant hoppers are also vectors of most currently 
known rice virus diseases. The more damaging 

species are green leaf hoppers Nephotettix spp., the 
zigzag leafhopper Recilia dorsalis (Motschulsky), the 
brown plant hopper Nilaparvatalugens (Stål), the 
small brown plant hopper Laodelphaxstriatellus 
(Fallen), the white backed plant hopper 
Sogatellafurcifera (Horváth), and the ricedelphacid 
Tagosodes (=Sogatodes) orizicolus (Muir), etc., also 
a serious threat to the paddy crop too. Hence, we 
need to control the cicadellidae family of insects else 
they can multiply significantly causing not only 
severe damage to the crops but also may spread 
various diseases including flus to humans, cattle and 
the plants. 

Affordable treatment of ancient times 

Use of Sulfur, known as Gandhak (in Hindi/Sanskrit) 
to control these insects from damaging the crops of 
rice and paddy was common. Modern day research 
also shows that Sulfur treatment is one among the 
best treatments for controlling such insects. We can 
use Sulfur not only to treat rice or paddy crops from 
these insects but also grapes, potato crops from these 
insects. Crackers contain Sulfur in them, so our 
ancestors used to burst crackers during Deepavali 
days to indirectly fill the atmosphere with Sulfur gas 
as natural treatment for the pests as a very cost 
effective and quick method.  

People in every nook and corner of the country make 
use of fire crackers containing Sulfur during 
Deepavali days along with the use of small oil lamps, 
lit using castor oil that are also known to purify 
environment harmlessly. 

Ancient Tradition - The Tubri competition 

The Purbannapara community of Makardah village 
in West Bengal holds an annual competition or 
‘protijogita’ for making the brightest and biggest 
‘tubri’ or firework-candle.  

Tubri, looks like Christmas tree or resemble a Roman 
candle. In this village elders teach the younger 
generation to make Tubri and other types of 
fireworks during Kali Puja (worshipped during 
Deepavali in the eastern part of Bharat especially 
West Bengal and Odisha) See Photo in the next page. 

A tubri consists of a powdered mixture of Saltpeter, 
Sulfur and Charcoal, combined with iron filings 
stuffed tight into a spherical shell made of baked 
earth with a small hole at the top of the casing that 
allows lighting the powder. 

Each team has its own secret formula for the 
quantities and graininess of the ingredients, 
pounded and mixed fresh for maximum effect. The 
competition commences with the lighting of a tubri. 
The firework is set inside a cubical metal frame, 
designed and made by local engineers, to protect the 
audience from flying fragments. Judges sitting at tall 
building roof tops grade the height and other 
attributes of the fireworks and declare the winners. 
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Savarkundla residents fight cracker wars 

Savarkundla is a city municipality in Amreli district 
in the state of Gujarat. It is a twin city formed when 
the cities of Savar and Kundla merged. Residents of 
the two villages gather on their side of the river every 
Deepavali and throw fire-crackers at each other as if 
they were fighting a war. Even today, Savarkundla 
villagers do not buy firecrackers from the market but 
make it locally at home and call these homemade 
firecrackers as ‘Ingoriya’ and ‘Kokdi’. When lit, both 
burn like small flowerpots. 

‘Ingoriya’ is the fruit of a wild tree. People fill up the 
hollow shell with potash, coal powder and other 
inflammables after removing the pulp and seed 
inside the fruit. Kokdi is also a wood firecracker 
derived from wild bamboo’. 

Muslims and Fireworks 

Mughal Tyrant Aurangzeb during his rule, from 1665 
onwards, banned the use and display of fireworks 
during Deepavali because he considered it to be a 
‘Hindu practice’. The exhibit preserved at the 
Bikaner Museum is a proof on the same. Anti-Hindu, 
pro-Muslims politicians present in I. N. D. I. A., 
along with their associates, the anti-Hindu Indian 
Judiciary (Supreme Courts & High Courts) are today 
banning fireworks display, the traditional ritual of 
the Hindus during Deepavali celebrations under the 
garb of it creating pollution, to complete the circle. 

Additionally, behind this is also the ideology of 
Communism (or rather the communist party leaders) 
that benefits when the country’s citizens (so-called 
oppressed class and so-called oppressor class) 
themselves are at war with each other.  

Communists Naxals for this reason, alone keep 
opposing all established policies and democratically 
organized set-ups (Govt), country culture, its 
traditions and practices, etc., to keep the country and 
the people living there in continuous unrest and 
strife. The all-time communist ideology is always to 
grab power at any cost! Basic communist philosophy 
is to oppose, establishments in power in the garb of 
helping the poor and the downtrodden until they 
come to power, and then loot the country’s wealth 
filling up their own pockets with the legitimate 
wealth of others with impunity, without conscience.  

Adherents of communism exist and thrive in every 
country all over the world. The so-called self-
proclaimed liberals, influenced by communism 
normally present themselves as elite, urban 
educated, organized suave influencers in the world 
and always oppose Hindus, their festivals and the 
supporting nationalist forces to achieve their 
personal, political and ideological goals in line with 
their agendas. 

The traditions associated with Deepavali, including 
the bursting of crackers has a deep significance and 
to brand it as environment unfriendly is biased. The 
vilification of Deepavali and Hindus who celebrate it, 
by basing it on environmental grounds is reckless 
and patently unfair. The Green Deepavali syndrome 
is to make Hindus weak by killing their local rituals 
and its associated vibrancy basically to make them 
become consumerist slaves. Getting rid of our 
ancient customs and traditions just because certain 
individuals, with vested interests say it is harmful for 
the environment, only results in diluting the 
knowledge acquired after some thousands of years of 
practical wisdom! Think logically! Behave wisely! 


